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Nimesul ide is a newer non -steroidal 
anti-infalmm atory  agent  with addi tiona l 
anti-pyretic and  analgesic activity. Fo r 
many years the princ ipal non -steroida l 
anti-inflammatory drugs (NSAIDs) in use 
have been inhibitors of prostaglandin syn-
thesis like ibuprofen. The therapeutic effi-
cacy of these drugs usuall y correla tes with 
the reductio n in prostaglandin levels. How-
ever, this effect is also responsible for the 
inhibition of gastroprotective prosta glan-
dins leading to gastrointestinal intolerance.  
The development of new NSAIDs has fo-
cussed on the discovery of potent anti-in-
flamma tory compounds that disp lay alter-
native modes of action. Nimesulide is a 
non-steroidal anti-inflamma tory analgesic 
drug of the sulfoni lide class and is chem i-
cally 4 nitro  2 ph eno xy methanesu l-
fonnilid e. It differs from convent iona l 
NSAIDs both in structure  and pharmaco -
logical profile.

Nimesul ide produces irreversibl e inhi-
bition of prostaglandin synthet ase equal ly 
inhib iting forma tion of P GE2 and P GF2.

Nimesulide demonstrates anti-inflammato -
ry activity at a dose far lower than that as-
socia ted with gastro-intestinal toxicity(l). 
At doses that  inhibit  acute  inflamm ation, 
nimesulide has no effect on the arachidonic 
acid metabolism in organs such as stomach, 
kidne ys and lun gs norma lly affected by 
other NSAIDs. Moreover, the effect of 
nimesulide is more at inflamm atory sites. 
Nimesulide also acts by various other non-
prostag landin mechani sms which include 
free radical scavenging, effect on histamine 
release and activity, effect on neutro phil 
peroxidase, car tilage degrada tion and 
metalloprotease synthesis, phosphodiester -
ase type IV inhibition,  platelet aggregation 
and synthesis of platelet activ ating f actor(2-
6). Nimesul ide also exerts an ant i-inflam-
matory effect by inhibiting the release of 
tumor necrosis factor and thereby decreas -
ing cytokine release.  An ant ipyre tic effect  
of nimesulide was first demonstrated in 
experimental animals(7,8) . The therapeutic 
antipyretic effectiveness of nimesulide has 
now  been prov en clinically in various 
double blind studie s both in adu lts and 
children(9,10).

After oral adm inis tration, the drug is 
comp letely abso rbe d.  It is extens ively 
bound to serum proteins (99%) and is dis-
tribut ed throu ghout the tissues(11). It un-
dergoes rapid and extens ive biotransfor -
mation via several mechanisms. The princi-
pal metabolite  is its hydroxy deriva tive 
(OH-Nimesulide) conjugated with glucu-
ronic acid which is excreted in urine. It is 
more rapidly and extensive ly absorbed in 
children compared to adults. The terminal  
half life is shorter in children (2.36 hours) 
than in adults (3.02 hours)(12). In patients
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with moderat e renal failure, the termin al 
elimination half life of hydroxy-nimuselide 
is incre ased leadin g to its accumu lation.  
This accumula tion appears to have little 
clinical  significance. However, in patients 
with severe renal failure it is better to with -
hold the drug till the risks of accumulat ion 
of the metaboli te are well studied. Patients  
with liver disease should not receive the 
drug because of its elimina tion after glucu-
ronic acid conjugation. As a result of its ex-
tensive plasma  protein binding, nimesulide
may be displaced from bindin g sites by 
concurr ent ly adm inistered drugs like 
fenifibrate, salicylic acid and tolbutamide. 
No other major drug interactions of any 
clinical significance have been de-
scribed(13). Nimesulide may reduce the 
natriure tic response  to furosemide  and po-
tentiate the reduc tion in glomeru lar filtra-
tion and renal blood flow. Caution is to be  
exerc ised when prescribing nimesulide in 
combination with drugs known to adverse -
ly affect renal function(14). Few patients  
have shown  an increase  in anti-coagulant  
effect with warfarin when given concomi -
tantly with nimesulide.

Studies to date suggest that nimesul ide 
is an effec tive anti-inflammatory and anal-
gesic agent in the treatm ent of osteoarth -
ritis, rheumatoid arthrit is, acute and chron -
ic respiratory tract inflamma tion, otorhino -
laryn golog ical inflamma tion, dysm enorr -
hea and thrombophlebit is. The  drug is 
contr aindi cated with a history of pr ior  
hyper sensitivit y and in gastric ulcer or 
hemorrhage. The recommended dose in 
children is 5 mg/kg per day in 2 or 3 divid -
ed doses for 7-10 days. This duration of 
therapy is effective in controlling the in-
flamma tory process in upper airway disor -
ders like rhin itis, rh inosinus itis, phar yn-
gitis and secretory otitis medi a(15). It is 
capable of modu lating the  inf lammatory

process by scaveng ing the free radicals 
which cause tissue dam age and produce 
rapid recovery of the import ant func tions  
of the respiratory mucosa. This may pre-
vent development of complications such as 
chronic sinusitis or bronchopulmonary dis-
ord ers(16).  In  patients with susp ected 
bacterial infec tion, ant ibio tic therapy  
should also be prescribed to facilitate full 
recovery. In addition, som e studi es 
indic ate that nime sulide  has  greater anti-
inflamm atory  effects than other NSAIDs 
which are due at least in part to the ability 
of nimesulide not only to inhibit cyclo-
oxygenase pathways but also to act as 
scavenger  of free oxygen radicals.

In a stud y in chi ldren, treatment  with 
nim esu lide resu lted in norm alization of  
body tempera ture more rapidl y which was  
also long er lasting in comparison to 
paracetamol(17). During treatment, normal 
body temp erature was ach ieved after an 
average of  2.8 doses of nimesulide and 
4.7 doses of pa racetamol (p <0.01)(12). The 
combine d antipyretic and anti-inflammato-
ry effec ts of nim esul ide were  assoc iated 
with a more prono unced and rapid im-
provement in the general condition of pa-
tients than was observed with paracetamol.  
Antipyretic effects of nimesulide were 
documented to be better than mafenami c 
acid, aspir in and naproxan and definitive  
fever resolution was achieved with fewer 
doses(18-20).

At therapeu tic conc entration nime-
sulid e inhibi ts superox ide anion produc -
tion and has an inhibitory effec t on phos -
phodiesterase type IV. I nhibition o f this  en-
zyme is responsible for suppressing hista-
mine release from basophils and hence it is 
useful in the treatment of chronic asthma.  
Broncho-constriction because of cyclo-
oxygenas e inhibi tion is not seen with  
nim esu lide as it do es no t incr ease 5 
lipoxygena se products(21).
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At presen t ther e are no large lon g term  
studi es to adequa tely assess the overal l 
incidence of side effects with nimesulide.  
Heart burn, excess ive perspira tion, flush -
ing, hyperexc itabil ity and skin rash are the 
occasional side effects rep orted(22). The in-
cidence of adverse events usually ranging  
between 0 to 10% increase with a longer 
duration of therapy.

Nimesul ide is ava ilable as table ts (100 
and 200 mg), susp ension (50 mg/5ml) and 
transgel form for local ap plication.

Although the studies on antipyretic effi-
cacy of nimesu lide in chi ldren are limited 
in number, where comparative agents have 
been  used , this dru g has prov en to be at 
least as eff icacious (and in man y cases 
more effective). With its convenient dosage 
schedule of twice daily administra tion and 
almos t the same cost, nimesu lide appear s 
to offer a usefu l alternative to other 
NSAIDs in the symptomatic treatment of 
children with inflamm atory condition s 
and/or pain and fever states. However, ad-
ditional long term data is desirabl e to reaf-
firm its general safety in children especially 
for prolonged use.
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